WATER WORKS MATERIALS
BID RESULTS
MARCH 10, 2015

Bid No. [Description Capitol Supply HD Supply Waterworks Water Works Supply

1 DICL Pipe and MJ Fittings No Bid $14,899.36 $14,995.32
2 MJ Seat Gate Valves No Bid $13,230.00 $15,209.00
3 Tapping Sleeves and Valves No Bid $8,447.00 $8,565.00
4 Valve and Curb Boxes and Parts; MJ Restraints No Bid $8,824.00 $8,825.90
5 Copper Tubing No Bid $18,005.00 $20,096.00
6 Water Service Materials No Bid Incomplete $19,704.66
7 Repair Clamps and Sleeves No Bid $14,888.82 $16,291.29
8 Fire Hydrants and Repair Parts No Bid No Bid $50,021.16

Totals of low bids received No Bid $78,294.18 $69,725.82
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